
Perth, Australia; Augsburg, Germany; 9th April 2010. The Australian music label Hidden Shoal 
Recordings today announced the release of the single ‘Hubble’ by German experimental ambient 
artist Markus Mehr.

The first track to be taken from the forthcoming album Lava, ‘Hubble’ roves glacially across 
compelling, hypnotic terrain. Atop a bedrock of fuzzy synths, glistening counter-melodies arc from 
the surface in all directions, tracing shards of light across the coal-black skies. The track evokes 
time spent transfixed, gazing through a giant looking glass, waiting wide-eyed as new discoveries 
are revealed in the music’s textured contours.

Markus Mehr’s musical journey began with the guitar. He grew up listening to bands like Black 
Sabbath and AC/DC, before turning his ears to darker sounds and the ethereal, experimental pop 
of David Sylvian. After recording and touring with several bands, he struck out on his own with 
home studio project Aroma.

Now working under his own name, Mehr wrote and recorded his upcoming debut album Lava at 
his home studio using guitars and synths, plus any noise-making accoutrements at hand – electric 
shavers, ventilators, electric tooth brushes and field recordings – all processed and distorted to 
create a gorgeous wall of sound, akin to the classic ’70s Kosmische music of Klaus Schulze and 
Tangerine Dream, but also the contemporary masters of textured luminosity, Fennesz and Tim 
Hecker. Mehr’s live plans for the European summer of 2010 include performances in churches, 
galleries and large disused gas tanks, as well as collaborations with visual artist Stefanie Sixt.

‘Hubble’ is available for free download from the Hidden Shoal Store until the release of the album 
Lava on the 15th of June.

Hidden Shoal Recordings is an Australia-based independent music label that has earned a 
reputation for releasing exciting and engaging new independent music that is not bound by genre 
or style. Hidden Shoal Recordings was chosen as one of the top ten favourite labels of 2007 by 
Textura magazine, and has been dubbed “This generation’s 4AD” by prominent New York radio 
host DJ Mojo.

Label Site: http://music.hiddenshoal.com
Label Store: http://agora.hiddenshoal.com
Markus Mehr: http://www.myspace.com/markusmehr
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